

USA Diving Winter National Championship December 11th-18th 2022 (Tax Not Included)

Property	Rating	Phone	Single, Double, Suites	Added Amenities Near By	Cut-off Date	Breakfast	Wifi	Parking	Mylan Park and Aquatic Center
Best Western Moutaineer Inn	2 Star	304-599-5399	Single \$75.00 Double \$79.00 Use the following link to book your stay; https://www.bestwestern.com/en_US/book/hotel-rooms.49033.html?groupid=6U4YH7V5	Shopping and Restaurant		Yes	Yes	Yes	3 Miles
Courtyard by Marriott	3 Star	304-599-1080	No bid	Shopping and Restaurant		Restaurant	Yes	Yes	4.6 miles
Candlewood	3 Star	304-241-2411	No bid	Shopping and Restaurant		No	Yes	Yes	3.1 miles
Cranberry	3 Star	304-403-6300	Single or Double \$129.00 use rate code LCVBPR when booking *	Shopping and Restaurant		Yes	Yes	Yes	20 miles
Euro-Suites	3 Star	304-598-1000	Single \$94.00 Double \$99.00	Shopping and Restaurant	Dec.1st	Yes	Yes	Yes	6.3 miles
Fairfield Inn & Suites by Marriott	2 Star	304-598-5006	Single or Double \$124.00 Dec. 16th 18th No availability	Shopping and Restaurant	Dec.1st	Yes	Yes	Yes	3.9 miles
Hampton Inn	3 Star	304-599-1200	No bid	Shopping and Restaurant		Yes	Yes	Yes	5.9 miles
Hampton Inn and Suites	3 Star	304-598-0600	No bid	Shopping and Restaurant		Yes	Yes	Yes	4.7 miles
Holiday Inn Express	3 star	304-291-2600	No bid	Shopping and Restaurant		Yes	Yes	Yes	17 miles
Holiday Inn University	3 Star	304-241-6649	Single \$139.00 Double \$149.00 * usee rate code USD when booking	Shopping and Restaurant	Nov.27th	Restaurant	Yes	Yes	6.8 miles
Hotel Morgan	3 Star	304-292-8200	*Use rate code 121022USA when booking December 10th \$169 and \$189 December 11th-15th Single \$114 Double \$124 Dec. 16th and 17th Single \$199 \$219 Double	Shopping and Restaurant	Dec.1st	Restaurant	Yes	Additional Charge	7.2 miles
Hilton Garden Inn	3 Star	304-225-9500	Single or Double \$109.00 *Dec. 16th and 17th Rate is \$154.00	Shopping and Restaurant		Restaurant	Yes	Yes	7.4 miles
Lakeview	2 Star	304-594-1111	Single or Double \$79.00	Shopping and Restaurant	Nov.28th	Restaurant	yes	Yes	20 miles
La Quinta Inn	2 Star	304- 241-4501	No bid	Shopping and Restaurant		Yes	Yes	Yes	3.1 miles
Motel 6	2 Star	304-599-8181	No bid	Shopping and Restaurant		Yes	Yes	Yes	4.4 miles
Residence Inn by Marriott	3 Star	304-599-0237	Single \$109.00 Doubles are N/A * all King suites have pull out sofa beds * use rate code USAP when calling to book	Shopping and Restaurant	Nov. 28th	yes	yes	Yes	6.7 miles
Scholar Hotel	3 Star	304-777-4100	No bid	Shopping and Restaurant		No	Yes	Yes	7.3 miles
SpringHill Suites by Marriott	3 Star	304-225-5200	No bid	Shopping and Restaurant		Restaurant	Yes	Yes	14 miles
Super 8	2 Star	304-296-4000	No bid	Shopping and Restaurant		Yes	Yes	Yes	17 miles
Suburban Extended Stay	2 Star	304-291-2535	Single \$90.00 Double \$110.00 use code BSOSLM when booking *	Shopping and Restaurant	Nov.10th	Yes	Yes	Yes	14 miles
SureStay Plus/Westover	2 Star	304-292-0055	No bid	Shopping and Restaurant		Yes	yes	Yes	5.9 miles
Waterfront Place	4 Star	304-296-1700	Single or Double \$189.00 rate code USA Diving when booking * use	Shopping and Restaurant	Nov.21st	Restaurant	Yes	Additional Charge	7.6 miles